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EZPAP vs. Aerobika as Therapy for Rib Fractures 

Rib fractures are a common injury, particularly in those who have suffered blunt trauma 
to the chest, such as from a motor vehicle accident or a fall. Treatment of rib fractures is 
primarily supportive, with a focus on pain management and prevention of complications 
such as pneumonia or respiratory failure. One such supportive therapy is positive 
expiratory pressure (PEP) therapy, which can be delivered using either oscillatory PEP or 
EzPAP PEP therapy. 

EzPAP PEP therapy is the preferred therapy for rib fractures over oscillatory PEP because 
it is a gentler therapy that can provide effective treatment without exacerbating the 
patient's pain or discomfort. EzPAP therapy involves the patient breathing through a 
handheld device that provides a constant flow of positive pressure during exhalation. 
This pressure helps to keep the airways open, preventing the collapse of the alveoli and 
improving gas exchange in the lungs. Additionally, the use of EzPAP therapy can help to 
mobilize and clear secretions from the airways, reducing the risk of complications such 
as pneumonia or atelectasis. 

In contrast, oscillatory PEP therapy involves the use of a device such as Aerobika that 
delivers oscillations or vibrations to the patient's airways during exhalation. While this 
therapy can also be effective at improving gas exchange and clearing secretions, it can 
be uncomfortable for patients with rib fractures. The vibrations can exacerbate pain and 
discomfort, making it difficult for patients to tolerate the therapy. Additionally, 
oscillatory PEP therapy can cause a rebound effect, leading to increased work of 
breathing and potentially worsening respiratory distress. 

EzPAP PEP therapy is a safe and effective therapy for patients with rib fractures, as it 
provides gentle positive pressure without causing discomfort or exacerbating respiratory 
distress. This therapy can be easily administered at the bedside by a trained healthcare 
professional, and can be adjusted to meet the patient's individual needs. Furthermore, 
EzPAP PEP therapy can be used in conjunction with other supportive therapies, such as 
pain management or supplemental oxygen, to optimize patient outcomes. 

In conclusion, EzPAP PEP therapy is the preferred therapy for rib fractures over 
oscillatory PEP due to its gentle and effective treatment, without exacerbating patient's 
pain or discomfort. By providing constant positive pressure, EzPAP therapy can improve 
gas exchange and clear secretions, reducing the risk of complications such as 
pneumonia or atelectasis. Patients with rib fractures can benefit greatly from EzPAP 
therapy, which is safe, effective, and easily administered at the bedside by a trained 
healthcare professional. 
 


